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P R E S S  S T A T E M E N T  
 
UNAIDS welcomes investments from Sweden and Germany for the 
responses to HIV and COVID-19  
 

GENEVA, 18 December 2020— UNAIDS strongly welcomes the announcement by Sweden at 
the 47th meeting of UNAIDS Programme Coordinating Board to renew its annual funding 
commitment to UNAIDS of SEK300 million in core funding for 2021, equivalent to 36 million 
USD, demonstrating the country’s continued leadership in the global AIDS response. In making 
the announcement, Sweden underscored UNAIDS role in working for sexual and reproductive 
health and rights.  

UNAIDS also welcomes Germany’s announcement, at the same meeting, of its decision to 
invest an additional €5 million in UNAIDS complementary responses to the HIV and COVID-19 
epidemics next year. This builds on the country’s contribution of €20 million to UNAIDS’ HIV 
and COVID-19 response in June this year and is on top of Germany`s annual contribution to 
UNAIDS of €5 million. In making the announcement, Germany recognized UNAIDS’ outstanding 
work in responding to the colliding epidemics of HIV and COVID-19 and called on other donors 
to consider increasing their contributions. 

“I want to thank Sweden and Germany for their strong leadership in the AIDS response as well 
as their confidence in and support for UNAIDS,” said UNAIDS Executive Director, Winnie 
Byanyima. “These contributions will allow UNAIDS to maintain our response to the HIV 
epidemic, while mitigating the effects of COVID-19 on vulnerable groups of people and 
mobilizing the AIDS response, its infrastructure and expertise against COVID-19.” 
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UNAIDS 
The Joint United Nations Programme on HIV/AIDS (UNAIDS) leads and inspires the world to 
achieve its shared vision of zero new HIV infections, zero discrimination and zero AIDS-related 
deaths. UNAIDS unites the efforts of 11 UN organizations—UNHCR, UNICEF, WFP, UNDP, 
UNFPA, UNODC, UN Women, ILO, UNESCO, WHO and the World Bank—and works closely 
with global and national partners towards ending the AIDS epidemic by 2030 as part of the 
Sustainable Development Goals. Learn more at unaids.org and connect with us on Facebook, 
Twitter, Instagram and YouTube. 

http://www.unaids.org/
http://www.facebook.com/UNAIDS
http://twitter.com/#!/UNAIDS
http://instagram.com/unaidsglobal
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