
 
 

 
 

P R E S S  R E L E A S E  
 
New UNAIDS and Lancet Commission to explore HIV and global 
health in the Post-2015 debate  

Malawi President Joyce Banda, African Union Commission Chairperson Nkosazana Dlamini 
Zuma and London School of Hygiene and Tropical Medicine Director Peter Piot to co-chair the 
new UNAIDS and Lancet Commission: From AIDS to Sustainable Health 

ADDIS ABABA, 26 May 2013—The Joint United Nations Programme on HIV/AIDS (UNAIDS) 
and leading medical journal The Lancet have convened a new commission of political and 
health leaders to explore the post-2015 agenda of AIDS and global health. 

The UNAIDS and Lancet Commission: From AIDS to Sustainable Health will be co-chaired by 
Malawi President Joyce Banda, African Union Commission Chairperson Nkosazana Dlamini 
Zuma and London School of Hygiene and Tropical Medicine Director Peter Piot. 

“In just a decade, I have witnessed countries move from despair to the conviction that we can 
end this epidemic,” said President Joyce Banda. “This Commission can offer a way forward that 
allows us to accelerate our march towards the end of AIDS.” 

Informed by a diverse group of HIV and health experts, young people, activists and political 
leaders, and drawing upon insights gained from online crowd-sourcing and engagement with 
constituencies, the Commission will deliberate on strategies to ensure that the vision of the 
AIDS movement—zero new HIV infections, zero discrimination and zero AIDS-related deaths—
can be realized in the coming decades.  

“Our work now must focus on how to bring the best minds and hearts together to end this 
epidemic.” said Nkosazana Dlamini Zuma, Chairperson of the African Union Commission. “We 
have seen the devastation that AIDS has wrought—now let our humanity overcome it and lead 
us to a brighter future.”   

The Commission will also closely examine the new tenets for better global health results—
including issues such as social equality for marginalised populations, empowering communities 
to demand better health services and accelerating access to affordable, quality medicines.    

“As a new agenda for development is being shaped, it is time for serious thought on how the 
extraordinary lessons from the AIDS response can be brought to bear to transform global 
health,” said Peter Piot, Director of the London School of Hygiene and Tropical Medicine. 

The Commission will have the opportunity to systematically reflect on evidence and make 
recommendations. Building on on-going consultations and the findings of the UN Secretary-
General’s High-Level Panel of Eminent Persons on the Post-2015 Development Agenda, the 
recommendations will contribute to and seek to influence the deliberations of Member States. 
The Commission’s work will culminate in a report published by the Lancet in early 2014.  
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“In so many important ways, the AIDS movement created global health. Now, as the MDG era 
comes to a close, the AIDS movement once again has an opportunity to use its great success 
and influence to shape a new epoch of sustainable development. Our joint Commission with 
UNAIDS aims to set out possible futures for the AIDS epidemic and the role of the AIDS 
community in reinventing global health for the new and more complex challenges of the 21st 
century,” said Richard Horton, Editor in Chief of The Lancet. 

The post-2015 agenda builds on the original eight Millennium Development Goals that Member 
States agreed to in 2000, of which Goal 6 is focused on the AIDS response.   

“Ending AIDS is a dream that is entirely possible,” said Michel Sidibé, Executive Director of 
UNAIDS. “The AIDS response has brought the world together to create a vision of shared 
responsibility and global solidarity—we have the opportunity now to harness this momentum 
and build a sustainable future, a future without AIDS.”  

The first meeting of the Commission will be hosted by President Banda in Lilongwe, Malawi on 
28-29 June.   

[END]  
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The Lancet | Daisy Barton | tel. +44 207 424 4949 | pressoffice@lancet.com 

 

UNAIDS  

The Joint United Nations Programme on HIV/AIDS (UNAIDS) leads and inspires the world to 
achieve its shared vision of zero new HIV infections, zero discrimination and zero AIDS-related 
deaths. UNAIDS unites the efforts of 11 UN organizations—UNHCR, UNICEF, WFP, UNDP, 
UNFPA, UNODC, UN Women, ILO, UNESCO, WHO and the World Bank—and works closely 
with global and national partners to maximize results for the AIDS response. Learn more at 
unaids.org and connect with us on Facebook and Twitter.  

 
The Lancet  

The Lancet's prestigious heritage as one of the world's leading medical journals continues to 
inspire its authors and editors today as they strive for medical excellence in all that they publish.  
The Lancet has an impact factor of 38·28. The journal is currently ranked second out of 153 
journals in the general medicine category (2011 Journal Citation Reports®, Thomson Reuters 
2012).  The journal publishes medical news, original research, and reviews on all aspects of 
clinical medicine and International Health; all journal content can be browsed in online Clinical 
and Global Health portals, and by specialty disciplines. Readers can interact via The Lancet's 
Facebook and Twitter social media sites; multimedia content is increasingly used to supplement 
key content in areas such as clinical video, the Global Health TV channel, and from regular 
audio podcasts. The Lancet iPad App can be downloaded via the iTunes store.  

  


